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Hi Revital, 
I will put things in motion. With best regards, Fred 
 
On 8/19/07, gabi gabi <gabi314@yahoo.com> wrote: 

Hello to all, 
  
Well, the time has come to finish things up !!  
  
Fred - you a a green light on getting the accountant's final financial report on srjo (for the years 
2006-2007). When that's ready - we'll meet in my office to sign the final protocol of the Amuta. 
Please let me know when it's ready.  
  
Zvi - I didn't get the details of the other Amuta srjo is transfering it's money, and I hope you'll send 
it asap. 
  
As you all might imagine - I didn't get ANYTHING in writing from Mr. Ruth (or anyone else, for 

that matter). The final day for that is tomorrow, so "don't lose hope yet"  
  
That's it. I'm waiting for you guys now to do your stuff. 
  
Thank you,  
  
Revital Baum, adv. 
Mefareket of SRJO 
  

Fussy? Opinionated? Impossible to please? Perfect. Join Yahoo!'s user panel and lay it on us. 
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+--------------------------+ 
Fred Altmann 
fred.altmann@gmail.com 
M 972-54-431 7637 
F  972 - 4-837 6467  
Skype: fredaltmann 
+---------------------------+ 
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